
104    The Management Accountant - November 2020				     www.icmai.in

INSTITUTE NEWS

EASTERN INDIA REGIONAL COUNCIL

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
BHUBANESWAR CHAPTER

To create further visibility and branding of CMA Profession, 
this  Chapter has felicitated  to  Shri  Situ Behera (Rank -1) 
and Miss Manasmita Mohanty ( Rank-2)  in +2 Commerce 
Examination -2020 of Council of Higher Secondary 
Education on 21.08.2020  at their Residence. On behalf of 
the Chapter CMA Debadatta Swain , Teaching Member and 
Shri H K Biswal, AAO facilitated  them and wished for their 
bright Professional  Career. Same was highlighted by six 
(6) nos. print Medias in Odiya and English.CMA Mukesh 
Chaubey , Chairman of the Chapter and CMA Uttam Kumar 
Nayak , the then Secretary of ICAI-EIRC felicitated to CMA 
Bijay Kumar Mohanty, Chief Programme Manager, REC 
Ltd. and Additional Charge of CEO, FACOR Power Ltd. 
on 25.08.2020. CMA Mukesh Chaubey , Chairman of the 
Chapter and CMA Uttam Kumar Nayak , the then Secretary 
of ICAI-EIRC felicitated to CMA Saroj Kumar Sahoo, Sr. G 
M (Fin) , PGCIL, Bhubaneswar on 25.08.2020. The Chapter 
has organized a WEBINT in Association with Department of 
Income Tax, Range-2, Bhubaneswar and Other Chapters at 
Odisha on 30.08.2020 on the theme “Faceless Assessment”. 
CMA Rakesh Bhalla, the then Chairman, Direct Taxation 
Committee, ICAI graced the occasion as  “Chief Guest” 
and CMA Niranjan Mishra, the then Chairman, Indirect 
Taxation Committee, ICAI graced the occasion as “Special 
Guest”. Shri Sitarama Rao, IRS, Additional Commissioner 
of Income Tax, Range-2, Bhubaneswar graced the occasion 
as “Guest of Honour” and delivered in detail on the topic 
as “Resource Person”. In a nut shell deliberation held on 
Faceless Assessment Scheme inaugurated as Phase 1 on 
7th Oct 2019 by Hon’ble Union Finance Minister, Govt. of 
India.	 CMA Mukesh Chaubey, Chairman of the Chapter 
delivered the welcome address and made brief introduction 
of Guest.CMA Saktidhar Singh, Chairman. Professional 
Development Committee of the Chapter delivered key 
note address.  CMA Ajay Kumar Samal, Secretary of the 
Chapter extended formal vote of thanks. Shri Sitarama Rao, 
IRS, Additional Commissioner of Income Tax , Range-2, 
Bhubaneswar was greeted on 01.09.2020. CMA Saktidhar 
Singh, Chairman, PD Committee and Immediate Past 
Chairman of the Chapter and CMA Niranjan Mishra, the then 
Chairman, Indirect Taxation Committee presented memento 
and conveyed gratitude for his gracious presence and 
association of the department on the occasion of WEBINT 
on “Faceless Assessment” held on 30.09.2020. The Chapter 
has organized a WEBINT on “An Insight to Income Tax 
Return” in association with Other Chapters at Odisha on 
7th September, 2020 .CMA H Padmanabhan , the then 
Chairman, Regional Councils and Chapters Coordination & 
CAT  Committee  and AAT Board of the Institute  graced 
the occasion as “Chief Guest” and Dr.  Abhishek Murali,  
Secretary, Southern India Regional Council of The Institute 
of Chartered Accountants of India, Chennai addressed on 
the topic with lot of analytical data as “Resource Person”. 

CMA Saktidhar Singh, Chairman, PD Committee delivered 
welcome address and CMA Ajay Kumar Samal, Secretary 
of the Chapter extended formal vote of thanks.As a matter 
of the Culture of the Chapter and prevailing practice , CMA 
Ajay Kumar Samal, Secretary of the Chapter welcomed to 
CMA Pallab Bhattacharya, the then Chairman, ICAI-EIRC 
during his visit to Bhubaneswar Chapter in the presence of 
CMA Uttam Kumar Nayak, the then Secretary , ICAI-EIRC 
and CMA B B Nayak, the then Vice Chairman, ICAI-EIRC.
This Chapter has organized a WEBINT on “Post COVID-19 
Rejuvenation of MSME & AGRICULTURE SECTOR (A 
way forward towards Atmanirvar Bharat)” in association 
with all other Chapters of Odisha on 4th October, 2020.  
Shri Sibananda Bhanja, Circle Head, Punjab National Bank, 
Circle Office, Cuttack addressed  on “AGRICULTURE 
SCHEME FOR ENTERPRENURE” and Shri Susanta 
Kumar Mishra, Regional Head, Sambalpur, Union Bank 
of India addressed on “Post COVID-19 Rejuvenation of 
MSME” as  “Resource Person”. CMA Saktidhar Singh, 
Chairman, PD Committee of the Chapter delivered welcome 
address and extended formal vote of thanks. CMA Surya 
Narayan Tripathy, Member, PD Committee of the Chapter 
delivered key note address on the occasion .   CMA Saktidhar 
Singh, Chairman, PD Committee of the Chapter met to Shri 
Shri Sibananda Bhanja , Circle Head, Punjab National Bank, 
Cuttack Circle , presented memento and appraised the role 
of CMA’s in banking sectors on October 4, 2020.
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NIRC &the Chapter in association with The SSI 
Association,Kota organised the Webinar on “One time 
Restructuring (OTR) of Loan- Benefits & Challenges” on 
12th September 2020. CMA Sunil Pandey (CMA,CA, and 
IIM-C Alumni) was the expert faculty of the webinar.

Health Talk”. The session was conducted by CMA Mandeep 
Singh, Joint Secretary, Beawar Chapter. CMA Mandeep 
Singh, Joint Secretary of the Chapter introduced and 
welcomed the Chief Guest CMA Harkesh Tara, Chairman, 
NIRC and Guest of Honour CMA Rajendra Singh Bhati, 
RCM, NIRC. CMA Jyoti Maheshwari introduced the 
Keynote Speaker, Mrs. Ritu Agarwal, Facilitator and Teacher 
at the Art of Living Happiness and Wellness Programs and 
Certified Yoga Instructor. Mrs. Ritu not only showed many 
exercises that can be done at work, she also stressed on 
the benefits of meditation and pranayam for improving the 
quality of life. the program ended with a small talk by the 
guests and vote of thanks by Chairman, Beawar Chapter, 
CMA Rupesh Kothari.The third webinar of the series was on 
the topic “Strategy to pass Limited Insolvency Examination 
and Opportunities for Professionals in IBC 2016.” This 
Webinar was jointly conducted by Beawar Chapter and Kota 
Chapter of Cost Accountants on 18th October, 2020. CMA 
AkashAgarwal, Chairman, Kota Chapter and CMA Rupesh 
Kothari Chairman, Beawar Chapter welcomed the the Chief 
Guest CMA (Dr.) S.K.Gupta, CEO, Insolvency Professional 
Agengy-ICAI, and Guests of Honour, CA Manohar Bhandari, 
DGM (Taxation), Shree Cement Limited, Beawar and 
Advocate Raj Kumar Vijay, President, Tax Bar Association. 
CMAs Tapesh Mathur, Vice Chairman, A.K. Jethaliya, 
Secretary, Surendra P Gupta, Treasurer, MukutSonkhiya, 
Satyawan Sharma, Kota Chapter, and CMAs Maneesh Jain, 
Vice Chairman, Mitesh Chopra, Secretary, Mandeep Singh, 
Joint Secretary, JyotiSarda, Treasurer, Aditi Gaud, Beawar 
Chapter, introduced the eminent guests and speakers. The 
Keynote Speaker for the day CMA J.K. Budhiraja (Founder 
CEO, Insolvency Professional Agengy-ICAI,), pointed out 
the changes between the current and the new syllabus which 
will come into effect from 1st Jan 2021. He also spoke about 
the eligibility criteria, registration process, examination 
centers, study material and exam preparation in detail. At 
the end, Program Convener, CMA S. N. Mittal, Chairman 
PD Committee, Kota Chapter, thanked all the participants, 
guests, members of Kota and Beawar Chapter and CMA 
JatinAgarwal of Technical team for active participation in 
the program and for making it a grand success.

INSTITUTE NEWS

NORTHERN INDIA REGIONAL COUNCIL

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
KOTA CHAPTER

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
BEAWAR CHAPTER

The Chapter started series of webinars for sharing 
knowledge among professionals and students, named as 
“Enhance Knowledge – Enlighten Yourself “. The first 
webinar was on 4th October 2020 on the topic “Key Issues 
in GST Annual Returns & Audit.” CMA Mitesh Chopra, 
Secretary, of the Chapter gave opening remarks and 
welcomed chief guest CMA Satya Narayan Mittal, and Guest 
of Honour CMA Prakash Kothari. Thereafter CMA Jyoti 
Sarda, Treasurer of the Chapter welcomed the Key Speaker 
and participants. Key Speaker of the Webinar was CA Ankit 
Somani, Leading Tax Practitioner from Ajmer. He explained 
in detail the key issues in GST Annual Returns & Audit and 
also recent developments in GST. CMA Rupesh Kothari, 
Chairman of the Chapter thanked all the participants.The 
second webinar was on 11th October on “Desktop Yoga and 
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As per the directives received from Taxation Research 
Department (TRD), ICAI, a WEBINT on the Topic, 
“Faceless Assessment 2020” was organised by SIRC on 
11th September, 2020.  Chief Guest was Dr G M DOSS 
Commissioner Income Tax, now Addl. Director General 
(Vigilance - South Zone). CMA S S VINOTH KUMAR, Tax 
Consultant was the resource person. CMA H. Padmanabhan, 
Council Member – ICAI hosted the event and welcomed 
the Chief Guest, Guest Speaker and CMA Dignitaries 
and Members to the event. He appreciated the TRD for 
initiating the program & SIRC for organizing the program. 
CMA Rakesh Balla, Chairman, Direct Taxation Committee, 
thanked the Chief Guest and Guest Speaker for accepting the 
invite to address the CMA members, in spite of their busy 
schedule.  He also thanked Shri Narendra Modi, Hon’ble 
Prime Minister of India, for introducing the ‘Faceless 
Assessment’ Scheme, a transparent and relevant scheme 
during the COVID-19 pandemic.  CMA (Mrs.) Jyothi Satish, 
Chairperson – SIRC in her opening remarks said that it is 
our pleasure and privilege to invite all as per the directive 
from HQ for this PD Programme on ‘Faceless Assessment 
2020’.  In her address, Chairperson – SIRC highlighted that 
‘Time is more important’ in the present day world.  ‘Faceless 
Assessment’ scheme is a very good initiative by the Govt. 
during the present   pandemic situation and surely Cost 
Accountants will play an important role in bridging the gap 
between the Government and the stakeholders. She also 
thanked the Institute, especially Taxation Committees and 
RC & Chapters Coordination Committee for organising this 
Programme for the benefit of the members at the right time 
and while concluding she introduced the Chief Guest Dr.G 
M Doss, Commissioner of IT, Chennai and Addl. Director 
General (Vigilance – South Zone) & recalled & appreciated 
the one Day seminar by him & team at SIRC last year. 
The Chief Guest Dr. G.M. Doss in his address expressed 
his happiness in addressing CMA Members who involve 
themselves in nation building activities.  The Resource 
Person, CMA S.S. Vinoth Kumar, Tax Consultant from 
Chennai who was introduced by CMA (Mrs.) Jyothi Satish, 
Chairperson – SIRC in his address   mentioned that the 
Chief Guest covered all the major topics to be addressed by 
him and hence wished to address a few, specific topics, viz. 
‘Historical Evolutions’, ‘Faceless Assessment Ecosystem’ 
and ‘ Powers with Jurisdictional AO’. He also brought some 

practical points/issues, to the notice of the Chief Guest.  As 
part of the programme, question-answer session was held 
during which Dr G M Doss,   addressed the queries raised 
by the participants. CMA (Mrs.) Jyothi Satish, Chairperson 
– SIRC, in her concluding remarks pointed out that the 
enormous knowledge and varied work experience of the 
Chief Guest was visible in his deliberation of the topic  
‘Faceless Assessment’ & he has passionately explained the 
step-by-step processes involved there in. She expressed 
heartfelt gratitude to Chief Guest for being present with the 
CMA Professionals throughout the program and sharing his 
valuable inputs. CMA Rajat kumar Basu, Secretary, Indirect 
Taxation Committee – ICAI thanked the Chief Guest and 
Resource Person for  their valuable and thought-provoking 
address on ‘Faceless Assessment’.  PG & Research 
Department of Commerce, Dwaraka Doss Goverdhan 
Doss Vaishnav College, Chennai inaugurated the 3rd batch 
crash course in GST organised in association with the Tax 
Research Department, The Institute of Cost Accountants 
of India on 16th September 2020.Prof. S. Seshadrinathan 
initiated the event with a holistic and spiritual prayer and 

INSTITUTE NEWS

SOUTHERN INDIA REGIONAL COUNCIL
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THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
COIMBATORE CHAPTER

Dr. J. Jayasankar, Head of the Department of Commerce, 
welcomed the gathering via virtual mode. The Event was 
presided by CMA Biswarup Basu, Vice President, ICAI.  
The Students interacted with the Vice President, Key Note 
speaker and with the other officials of the TRD, Institute.
Keynote Address was delivered by CMA Raju Iyer P, 
Council Member & Chairman – IAASB , ICAI .  CMAs H 
Padmanabhan,  Dr. V Murali, Council Members – ICAI &  
CMA (Mrs.) Jyothi Satish, Chairperson – SIRC conveyed 
their greetings to the organisers electronically. The event was 
co-ordinated by CMA RajatBasu, Tax Research Department 
– ICAI  & CMA Rakesh Shankar Ravisankar, Chennai.

The Chapter Chairman visited Bharathiyar University on 
14th September, 2020     and had a meeting with the Registrar 
in connection with recognition of CMA qualification for 
admission to M.Phil/Ph.D. He has presented a representation 
to the Registrar. Chapter MC Member & past Chairperson 
CMA Meena Ramji, in-charge   of Students’ Training & 
Placement conducted an online meeting with the Chapter 
students on 20th September, 2020. On request from students 
a second online meeting was conducted on 11th October, 
2020 on the topic ‘ Tips for Resume writing’. There was a 
special address by past MC Member CMA C R Shivkumaran, 
Company Secretary, Lakshmi Machine Works Limited, 
Coimbatore to the students on the topic.The Chapter Jointly 
with the   Department of Commerce, Hindusthan College 
of Arts & Science, Coimbatore organised “Kahoot-T20 
National Level Commerce Quiz Competition” from 
19.09.2020 to 29.09.2020. The competition was conducted 
online.The Chapter Chairman conducted online career 
counselling programs to the students at local Colleges on 
various dates of August and September 2020.

contracts with Customers’ Ind AS 115”, “Public Procurement 
Management – Policy, Process & Reforms” (with reference 
to Govt. of India & Govt. of Karnataka), “Business Ethics” 
on various dates of September 2020. Shri M. Madhava, 
Management Consultant - Insurancetech , CMA Guruprasad 
V.- Management Consultant, Shri S.K. Manjunath , Former 
Provident Fund Commissioner - Bengaluru II, Karnakata, 
Ministry of Labour and Employment, GOI, CMA S. 
RudraPrakash, Technical Accountant, Corporate Financial 
Reporting – HP Inc, Shri. Rajeswar H.N, Consultant – 
Public Procurement Management, CS Gopalakrishna Hegde, 
Chairman, STRTA Consulting Services Pvt. Ltd., Former 
Member – National Council, ICSI, Delhi were the speakers 
of the Meets. Dhee-Vikasa Students Study Circle Meeting 
on Mutual Funds and M S Excel Practical Approach were 
organized by the chapter.

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
BANGALORE CHAPTER

The Chapter organized various professional development 
meets on “Impact of new technologies like Artificial 
Intelligence on the work of Finance Professionals”, 
“Occupational Fraud - An Introduction”, “An Insight into 
the Employees’ Pension Scheme 1995”, “Revenue from 

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
KOZHIKODE MALAPPURAM CHAPTER

A MoU was signed between the Chapter and St.Joseph’s 
College, Devagiri in Calicut on 30th September,2020.CMA 
Askarali P.C, Chairman of the chapter, Mr.Bony Augustine, 
Administrator of St.Joseph’s College, Devagiri, Mr Sunil 
M Antony, Director of St.Joseph’s College, Devagiri & 
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On September 1, 2020 the chapter organized a Course on 
Company Law Works by Practising Cost and Management 
Accountants – Session 2. CMA P. Chandra Sekhara Reddy 
detailed how-to increase the authorized capital of a company, 
practical aspects of the draft resolutions and contents in the 
E-forms etc. On September 6, 2020 the chapter organized 
a programme on scope of Internal Audit for CMAs and 
risk-based internal audit. CMA Dr. A.S. Durga Prasad Garu 
CMA Dr K. Ch. A.V.S.N. Murthy Garu acknowledged the 
contribution of CMA B.B. Goyal towards our profession. 
CMA Dr K.Ch. A.V.S.N. Murthy Garu emphasized the 
importance of the Internal Audit by giving example about 
“TOSHIBA.” CMA Raju Iyer told that Internal Audit is an 
area where our professionals get a lot of opportunities. CMA 
GOYAL deliberated Conceptual and practical issues in an 
excellent manner. His presentation covered Internal Audit 
Importance, objectives of Internal Audit, Skills of Internal 
Audit, Scope of Internal Audit, Core Principles of Internal 
Audit, Internal Audit Standards, and Legal Provisions on 
Internal audit, Glossary of important terms used in Internal 
Audit etc. On 13.09.2020 the chapter organized a programme 
on Internal Audit in Cement Industry. CMA U. Lakshmana 
Rao gave a very exhaustive presentation that covers 
Glossary of Terms in Cement Industry, Overview of Cement 
Industry, Process of Manufacture, Special Transactions 
to Cement Industry, Internal Audit of Operational Areas 
of Cement Industry, Effectiveness of Internal Audit in 
Cement Industry, Key Performance Indicators vis-à-vis 
benchmarking, Internal Audit of Functional Areas, Cost 
Audit in Cement Industry, Industry 4.0 in Cement industry, 
Cost of Setting up of New Cement Plant in India etc. On 
September 16, 2020 the chapter organized a programme on 
Building competitive advantage through Mgt. Accounting 
tools & techniques – A case study. Sri J. H. Rao explained 
the importance of Accounting tools & Techniques, Key 
challenges, strategies, Cost of capital, Industrial structure 
analysis, customer segmentation, key elements, the strategy 
choice cascade, Strategy map etc. As a part of ‘’Capacity 
Building for CMAs’ The Hyderabad Chapter has declared 
September month as Internal audit month. The Chapter 
has organised a series of webinars on “Capacity Building 
for CMAs on Internal Audit “and invited eminent resource 
persons and dignitaries to these programmes. On September 
20, 2020 the chapter organized a programme on Internal 

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
MYSURU CHAPTER

Mr.CMA Vijith.P, Treasurer of the chapter attended the 
programme.

Sarada Vilas College, Department of Commerce and 
Business Administration   Internal Quality Assurance Cell, 
Krishnamurthypuram, Mysuru in association with The 
Institute of Cost Accountants of India-Mysuru Chapter 
had organized a Webinar on “Role of CMA Professionals 
in Economic Development and Professional Avenues 
for CMAs”on  12th October 2020. Smt. Dr. Jyothi. A.N. 
Assistant Prof.PG Centre, HOD department of Commerce 
and business Administration of Saradavilas college 
welcomed the participants and told that today’s platform 
is to gain the knowledge. The seminar was inaugurated by 
Prof. Sathyanarayana, Dean Department of Commerce, 
Saradavilas college.CMA Dr.Tinesha. T.R. Secretary of 
the chapter was a Resource Person for the Webinar who 
spoke about “The Role of CMA professionals in Economic 
Development and Professionals Avenues for CMAs“with 
his valuable inputs through Power Point Presentation. 
CMA Ashok Kumar M, Chairman of the chapter was the 
invitee and he was present throughout the webinar. Sri. 
Parthasarathy. B.S. President, Sri.K. Srinath Ho. Secretary 
and Smt. Dr.Devika, Principal of Saradavilas Educational 
Institution was also present. Smt. Arpitha.K., Asst. Professor 
PG centre M.Com Saradavilas College Mysuru proposed 
vote of thanks.

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
HYDERABAD CHAPTER
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Audit for Process Efficiency – CMA K.S.N. Murthy & 
Forensic Angle on Internal Audit -Speaker CMA Mrityunjay 
Acharjee, Practicing Cost Accountant. CMA K.S.N. 
Murthy with his authoritative knowledge explained about 
statutory provisions, About Internal Audit, Audit Universe, 
how internal audit starts, planning an Internal Audit, Eight 
areas of waste, The Five Cs and Risk and Internal Audit, 
Risk Appraisal, Process Effectiveness vs Process efficiency, 
Stages in-process review, Process Efficiency Metrics, 
Cost Control strategies, Cost Control Methods, Internal 
Controls, types of Controls etc. Forensic audit has gained a 
lot of importance in recent days. CMA Mrityunjay Acharjee 
explained the benefits of using technology in forensic 
audit, skills required by a forensic auditor, identifying and 
analyzing the possibility of fraud etc.In order to facilitate the 
companies registered in India to make a fresh start on a clean 
slate, The Ministry of Corporate Affairs has decided to take 
certain alleviative measures for the benefit of all companies 
on September 22, 2020. CS N. Varalakshmi, Practising CS, 
Insolvency Professional, Register valuer explained about 
those measures and circulars. Shri Josekutty VE, ROC was 
invited as chief guest for this programme. The chapter on 
27.09.2020 organized a programme on Internal Audit in 
the Era of New Normal, Valedictory session & Release of 
souvenir. This programme started with Panel discussion. 
CMA B. Mallikharjuna Gupta, Chief Taxologist - Logo 
Infosoft, CMA Suraj Prakash – Director (Finance) – BEML 
Ltd, Shri T. Neelakanta Menon- President- IIA-Hyderabad 
Chapter, CMA Ashwani Kumar Agarwal,- Founder Team – 
AAKA took part in the panel discussion.The programme was 
followed by a Valedictory Session. CMA Biswarup Basu – 
President, CMA P. RajuIyer – Vice President and CMA K. 
Ch. A.V.S.N. Murthy- CCM of our Institute and CMA Jyothi 
Satish –Chairperson-SIRC of ICMAI were invited during 
the session.

WESTERN INDIA REGIONAL COUNCIL

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
PIMPRI CHINCHWAD AKURDI CHAPTER

The Chapter conducted webinar on ‘Preparation of 
Resolution Plan under IBC’ on 6th September, 2020 

through Google Digital platform.CMA Pradeep Deshpande, 
Secretary welcomed all the members present for the 
webinar. He has introduced the speaker CMA L D Pawar, 
Practicing Cost Accountant and Past Chairman – WIRC of 
ICAI. CMA L D Pawar in speech focused on the objectives 
of IBC Code. The Chapter conducted webinar on ‘Effective 
and Useful Cost Audit in Manufacturing Industries’ on 12th 
September, 2020 through Google Digital platform. CMA 
Jayant Hampiholi, Chairman welcomed all the members 
present for the webinar. He has introduced the speaker 
CMA Dhananjay Kumar Vatsyayan, Practicing Cost 
Accountant.CMA Dhananjay Vatsyayan in speech started 
with types of Products and the Specifications in Industries. 
He gave the examples accordingly such as Automobile, 
Mobile, Pharmaceuticals, Chemicals, and Sugar etc.CMA 
Pradeep Deshpande, Secretary of the chapter gave the vote 
of thanks. The Chapter conducted webinar on ‘Total Cost 
Management’ on 19th September, 2020 through Google 
Digital platform. CMA Pradeep Deshpande, Secretary has 
welcomed all the members present for the webinar. He has 
introduced the speaker CMA Ashish Inamdar, Practicing 
Cost Accountant. CMA Ashish Inamdar in his speech said, 
our mission is to help our clients prosper by providing them 
with a wide array of Professional Business and individual 
services, products and solutions to help them better manage 
their resources. CMA Sagar Malpure, Managing Committee 
Member – PCA Chapter gave the vote of thanks. The 
Chapter conducted webinar on ‘Unlock o Take-Off – A 
Paradigm shift for CMA’s’ on 26th September, 2020 through 
Google Digital platform.CMA Ashish Deshmukh, Past 
Chairman of PCA Chapter has welcomed all the members 
present for the webinar. He has introduced the speaker CMA 
Gopal Bhutada, Head – Business Finance, Tata Motors Ltd.
In live industry experiences he said that there are few key 
imperatives to ensure a strong cost strategy. A well-aligned 
organisation is key to drive long-term sustainability of 
benefits of cost strategy. The session was well interactive. 
The seminar was attended by members in practice, members 
from industries, professionals and students in large numbers.
CMA Pradeep Deshpande, Secretary of the Chapter gave the 
vote of thanks.

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
SURAT SOUTH GUJARAT CHAPTER

The Chapter organized a social awareness Program 
on “Positivity in Adversity” on 19th Sep. 2020 through 
the google meet. Speaker of the Program was Swami 
Shree Gnanvatsaldasji  from BAPS- Swaminarayan. The 
Chairman, CMA Bharat Savani presented a welcome 
address and Immediate Past Chairman, CMA Brijesh Mali 
gave introduction of the speaker to the members. Swamiji 
commenced the session and spoke about how to be positive 
in this pandemic situation by illustrating the examples of 
successful people around the world and answered several 
questions from the members. CMA Pankaj Kannaujiya, 
Secretary presented formal vote of thanks to the speaker 
and participants.By taking all necessary safety precautions 
& following the Government & HQ guidelines, the Chapter 
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hosted a Press Meet at the Chapter’s campus. CMA Bharat 
Savani, (Chairman), CMA Nanty Shah (Vice Chairman) 
CMA Brijesh Mali (Immediate Past Chairman), CMA Kishor 
Waghela, CMA Mahesh Bhalala (Managing Committee 
Members) and students joined the Meet. The Press Meet was 
being held for the declaration of results for foundation exam 
held for June 2020 term the exam was held online and in 
September due to Covid Pandemic. The Chapter organized a 
webinar on the subject of “Various Opportunities & products 
for CMAs & CMA students offered by Bank of Baroda” 
on 26th Sep 2020 through google meet. CMA Bharat 
Savani (Chairman) presented formal welcome address to 
all the participants.CMA Nanty Shah (Vice Chairman), 
CMA Keval Shah (Treasurer), CMA Kishor Vaghela and 
CMA Mahesh Bhalala – Managing Committee Members 
introduced the speakers to the participants. She spoke about 
how professions are being affected due to COVID 19 and 
the extensions made by the government to file the returns 
for TDS, Income Tax, GST and Corporate Law.The Chapter 
organized a Webinar on the subject of “Practical Issues 
Faced While Filing GSTR 9,9C and GST Audit” on 30th 
September 2020 through Google Meet. Chief Guest for 
the program was CMA Harshad Deshpandey, Chairman 
WIRC. Accompanied with CMA Dinesh Kumar Birla, Vice 
Chairman- WIRC, CMA Vikas Deodar, Past President- 
ICAI.CMA Nanty Shah (Vice-Chairman) recognized the 
presence of all dignitaries. CMA Bharat Savani (Chairman- 
Surat South Gujarat Chapter) presented the formal welcome 
address and also introduced the Chief Guest by briefing his 
profile & achievements to all the participants. CMA Dinesh 
Birla and CMA Vikas Deodar also graced the occasion by 
saying few words to the audience. CMA Manubhai Desai, 
Past Chairman of WIRC & Chaptergracedthe Occasion with 
briefing members and showering them with blessings and 
good luck.  CMA Keval Shah (Treasurer -SSGC) introduced 
CMA Nidhi Bhandhari, Speaker to the audience. CMA 
Nidhi commenced her session and gave a brief on Annual 
Return GSTR9. CMA Bhanwarlal Gurjar (Vice Chairman-
SSGC) introduced the second speaker CMA Dr. Shailendra 
Saxena- Past Chairman- SSGC. Shailendra Sir guided all the 
participants about The Practical Aspects of GSTR 9C & GST 
Audit. At the end of the session the speaker answered the 
queries of the participants. CMA Kishor Vaghela, Managing 
Committee Member of the Chapter presented formal vote 
of thanks.

The Chapter organized various CEP Programs during Aug-
Sept’20 for the members. The Program was inaugurated by 
welcome speech given by CMA Malhar Dalwadi, Secretary 
of Chapter. CMA Haren Bhatt, Chairman of Chapter and 
CMA Dakshesh Choksi, Chairman of PD Committee 
welcomed faculties during the session. There were many 
members, who have attended the programs organized by 
Chapter. The 3 days series workshop was also attended by 
many of Intermediate students as a part of their computer 
training. The programs were well appreciated by participants. 
CMA Malhar Dalwadi proposed vote of thanks.

THE INSTITUTE OF COST ACCOUNTANTS OF INDIA
AHMEDABAD CHAPTER

The  Chapter organized a Live session for members 
and other stakeholders on 9th September 2020 on “Data 
Analytics”. Chairman of chapter, CMA Kailash Shinde 
welcomed the speakers and the participants.   The speaker 
for the session was Dr. CMA Shilpa Parkhi, a Practicing 
Cost Accountant and Past Chairman of Nashik Ojhar 
Chapter. She explained the types of data analytics to improve 
the decision making process, how to choose the most 
appropriate data analytic tools etc.The session ended with a 
vote of thanks given by CMA Nikhil S.Pawar.The Chapter 
recently conducted a virtual Felicitation Programme for all 
foundation passed students on 27th Sept 2020. The Institute 
conducted for the first time an online exam for foundation 
due to a pandemic COVID 19 situation. The chief guest for 
said event was CMA R.K. Deodhar, (Past Chairman of Nasik 
Chapter) and CMA Chaitanya Moharir, Committee member 
of WIRC felicitated the successful students and guided them 
for future study and courses. The programme was attended 
by all successful students through the online mode. The 
Programme was coordinated by student Amit Jadhav and 
CMA Maithili Malpure (Oral coaching Faculty). Chairman 
CMA Kailas Shinde delivered his Chairman Speech and 
gave warm wishes to students on their success. CMA Nikhil 
S. Pawar (Managing Committee Member) addressed the 
students about various training conducted by the Chapter. 
CMA Mayur Nikam, Secretary of the chapter also wished 
students for their future career.  Vote of thanks was given by 
CA Deepak Jagtap, (Treasurer).


